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The most remarkable thing that Kennedy Mbeva, Reuben Makomere, 
Joanes Atela, Victoria Chengo, and Charles Tonui have achieved is the 
need to tell the Africa story. Their recent jointly co-authored book Afri
ca’s Right to Development in a Climate-Constrained World is a compre
hensive rendition of Africa’s sustainable development journey in the 
face of the continent’s economic consolidation and the shifting inter
national climate regime and in the context of the changing international 
power structure, which they characterize as an ‘onset of multipolarity’ 
(Mbeva et al., 2023: 21–23). 

The book consists of six chapters, in addition to an introduction and a 
conclusion. The book begins with a discussion of recent transformative 
initiatives in Africa—the adoption of the African Union Agenda of 2013, 
the ratification of the Paris Agreement of 2015, and the signing of the 
African Free Trade Agreement of 2018. These are representative of the 
two herculean tasks Africa undertakes simultaneously-its socio-eco
nomic development and industrialization which is a carbon-intensive 
endeavour, and climate action through National Adaptation Plans 
(NAP) which entails progressive reductions in greenhouse gas emissions. 
These two tasks seem to contradict each other. However, sustainability 
and development were reconciled, albeit discursively, within the 
framework of sustainable development in the Brundtland Convention of 
1978. The book is interested in unpacking the implementation of sus
tainable development and the practical unfolding of this term in the 
African context. 

Sustainable development is further contextualized in the changing 
nature of the international climate regime. This regime was initially 
formed on the principles of bifurcation of countries into two groups 
based on historical emissions, technology, capability, and finance 
transfer, and a static equilibrium. In this regime, African countries were 
included in the non-Annex list which meant that the industrialized 
countries (from Annex I) were obligated to provide the African countries 
with various kinds of support. However, this regime became untenable 
because of, as the authors argue, a shift in the international power 
structure from a unipolar to a multipolar order and led to a new inter
national climate regime. This new international regime, touted as post- 
Kyoto, was strengthened in the subsequent Conference of Parties (COP) 
at Copenhagen (in 2009) and Paris (in 2015), and characterized as a 
shift from bifurcated to universal participation, from technology transfer 
to technology absorption and building endogenous capacities, and from 
a static equilibrium to a dynamic pledge-review-ratchet mechanism 
where countries make progressive emission reduction commitments 
plans, and implement them. The narrative of historically calculated 
emissions was replaced with current emissions to accommodate the 

increasing emissions from emerging economies such as India, China, and 
Brazil. This new regime has brought several implications for Africa such 
as less dependence on the United States’ neoliberal order and foreign 
finance, technology transfer, and adoption of greater obligations to
wards climate action. It has led African countries to develop endogenous 
modes of industrialization in addition to increasingly turning to alter
native regimes discussed ahead. 

The regional integration of Africa has been accompanied by a 
distancing from ex-colonial powers. There has been a dramatic rise in 
Chinese and Indian investments in Africa through ambitious develop
mental diplomacy. These projects have been keen on integrating sus
tainability transitions in their development models. The book discusses 
crucial policy areas, such as renewable energy, water security, energy 
supply chains, and anti-fossil fuel norms that are gaining prominence in 
African political discourses making climate action more multi-sectoral, 
and thus complex. The complexity of the international climate regime 
has further increased with the rise of non-state actors at the supra as well 
as subnational levels in Africa. To this end, the authors argue that 
governing complexity is the most desirable approach for African coun
tries. This cognitive policy approach is alert and dynamic, and responds 
to change quickly, with a balanced and adaptive structure, and policy
makers assuming the role of complex designers to engage effectively. 

The book encourages African countries to instrumentalize their 
agency. For instance, in the UN Global Compact negotiations, African 
countries were at the forefront of opposing the industrialized countries’ 
lack of interest in providing implementation support. This led to the 
collapse of the negotiations because of the lack of agreement between 
the industrialized and developing countries. This incident illustrates the 
power of agency. Africa’s agency is also evident in its moving away from 
excessive dependence on ex-colonial countries to forging more equitable 
alliances with the Global South. 

The book makes several positive contributions that are worth 
mentioning here. The theoretical scaffolding provided by the authors to 
substantiate their arguments is rich and inter-disciplinary. These include 
complexity theory, public goods theory, theories of international re
lations, and Olson’s cooperation theory, among others. The book covers 
a vast stretch of information, what the authors describe as the ‘big pic
ture’ (Mbeva et al., 2023: vii). Although the flipside of the big picture 
approach is that a closer and more detailed look into the individual 
aspects of Africa’s climate policy landscape is missed, the book opens the 
floodgates to a lot of potential research ideas such as climate politics at 
sub-regional, national, and sectoral levels in Africa, and the role of 
non-state actors, private corporations, and transnational networks in 
climate action. 

Some aspects of the book deserve a critical rethinking. Firstly, the 
book is built on John Mearsheimer’s (2019) thesis that the current in
ternational power system is multipolar. However, multipolar world or
ders, in the longue durée of world history, have been unstable systems, 
replete with wars, and have generally defied collective action. A 
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question that emerges here is how would the analysis in the book change 
if the structural assumptions were built on Wohlforth and Brook’s (2016: 
7) thesis: ‘1 + 1 + X’ or simply a bipolar one? A bipolar world, where the 
United States and China constitute the two poles and pursue geopolitical 
games over the African continent, possibly offers geostrategic opportu
nities and economic choices to the African countries but at the same time 
challenges Africa’s resolve to economic consolidation, self-reliant 
development model, and climate action goals. 

Secondly, the theoretical framework of the book defines global 
climate change as a problem of collective action. However, scholars like 
Matthew Peterson (1996) have argued that such a characterization is 
simplistic and reduces the climate issue to one that can be solved with 
negotiations. Instead, they advocate a political economy approach to 
understand international climate politics rather than a regime approach. 
A political economy approach would be much more vigilant to the 
state’s role in capital allocation in the global structures of capitalism, 
and thereby would allow scholars to critically engage with the structural 
drivers of climate change in Africa. 

The book is a clarion call to African scholarship to develop these 
inquiries further and add to the scholarship on global climate politics. 
Their attempt to fill an important gap by providing an insider’s view
point of Africa’s big picture resonates well with the burgeoning schol
arship from other parts of the Global South that have represented the 
larger sentiments of the developing world. The book will be instructive 
to policymakers as it offers insights into the policy approaches that the 

authors have conceptualized as governing complexity. The book will 
also fascinate academics across social sciences and students, especially 
scholars of International Relations (IR), interested in global climate 
change, sustainability, African studies, and international politics. 
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